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North Tyneside Council

Freedom of Information Request FOI1685

Request:

1. For each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018, please state how much money was received by or on behalf
of the Council from Fixed Penalty Notices for 'dog fouling' (failing to forthwith remove faeces on designated land).

2. For each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018, please state how much money was received by or on behalf
of the Council from reuniting stray dogs with owners under Section 149(5) of the Environmental Protection Act
1990.

w

As at 31st March 2018 how many operators had a Council licence for:-

Selling animals as pets

Providing boarding for cats

Providing boarding in kennels for dogs
Providing home boarding for dogs
Providing day care for dogs

Breeding dogs
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B

As at 31st March 2019 how many operators had a Council licence for:-

Selling animals as pets

Providing boarding for cats

Providing boarding in kennels for dogs
Providing home boarding for dogs
Providing day care for dogs

Breeding dogs

-0 Q20 0Q

o

For each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018, please state how many prosecutions were brought by the
Council for failing to comply with the requirements of the Control of Dogs Order 1992 (collar & tag)

6. Of the prosecutions in (5) above, please state how many in each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018 led to
a conviction.

Submitted on 03/09/19.

Response:

1. For each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018, please state how much money was received by or on
behalf of the Council from Fixed Penalty Notices for 'dog fouling' (failing to forthwith remove faeces on
designated land).

2016/17 : Information not held on Dog Fouling. 2017/18: Information not held on Dog Fouling. 2018/19: Information not
held on Dog Fouling. North Tyneside Council received the following annual income from various Fixed Penalty Notices
including Dog Fouling as well as Littering, Street Cleansing and Refuse: 2016/17: £1,800 2017/18: £1,795 2018/19:
£3,640

2. For each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018, please state how much money was received by or on
behalf of the Council from reuniting stray dogs with owners under Section 149(5) of the Environmental
Protection Act 1990. 2016/17 : Information not held on income from reuniting stray dogs. 2017/18: Information not held
on income from reuniting stray dogs. 2018/19: Information not held on income from reuniting stray dogs.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You
are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any
other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of North Tyneside Council. Further enquiries in this respect
should be directed to Information Governance Team, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant, The Silver Link North, Cobalt
Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 OBY.
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3. As at 31st March 2018 how many operators had a Council licence for:-
a. Selling animals as pets

5

b. Providing boarding for cats

3

c. Providing boarding in kennels for dogs
2

d. Providing home boarding for dogs

81

e. Providing day care for dogs

5

f. Breeding dogs

1

4. As at 31st March 2019 how many operators had a Council licence for:-
a. Selling animals as pets

5

b. Providing boarding for cats

3

c. Providing boarding in kennels for dogs
2

d. Providing home boarding for dogs

49

e. Providing day care for dogs

5

f. Breeding dogs

1
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5. For each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018, please state how many prosecutions were brought by
the Council for failing to comply with the requirements of the Control of Dogs Order 1992 (collar & tag)

2016 -0

2017 -1

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You
are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any
other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of North Tyneside Council. Further enquiries in this respect
should be directed to Information Governance Team, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant, The Silver Link North, Cobalt

Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 OBY.
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2018-0

6. Of the prosecutions in (5) above, please state how many in each of the calendar years 2016, 2017 and 2018
led to a conviction.

2017 - 1 conviction

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You
are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any
other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of North Tyneside Council. Further enquiries in this respect

should be directed to Information Governance Team, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant, The Silver Link North, Cobalt
Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 OBY.
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