Reference: FOI1992

Request:

North Tyn;side Council

Regarding the clinical staff in your health visiting teams, on 1st February of 2016,
2017, 2018 and 2019:

1. Who provided/employed the health visitors commissioned by your local
authority? Please also provide their email address.

1st February 2016 to 31st March 2017 Northumbria Healthcare Foundation Trust was the
employer, the clinical lead was Katharine Taylor Katharine.taylor@northumbria-
healthcare.nhs.uk

1st April 2017 to date health visitors are employed by North Tyneside Council the
responsible senior officer is Wendy Burke Director of Public Health
wendy.burke@northtyneside.gov.uk and the Senior Manager and Professional Nursing
Lead is Joann Connolly joann.connolly@northtyneside.gov.uk

2. How many whole time equivalent clinical staff (with caseloads) coded as health
visitors were employed by that organisation in your health visiting teams? Please
provide these figures broken down by pay band.

We do not hold the information prior to 1st April 2017.
1st April 2017 WTE health visitors 33.09.
1st April 2018 WTE health visitors 39.49.
1st April 2019 WTE health visitors 34.89.

3. How many whole time equivalent clinical staff (with caseloads) who are NOT
coded as health visitors were employed by that organisation in your health visiting
teams? Please provide these figures broken down by pay band.

We do not hold the information prior to 1st April 2017 Clinical staff who are not coded as
health visitors do not hold their own caseloads, they have work delegated to them by
health visitors, only health visitors carry a caseload.

1st April 2017 WTE clinical staff (with caseloads) who are NOT coded as health visitors O.
1st April 2018 WTE clinical staff (with caseloads) who are NOT coded as health visitors 0.
1st April 2019 WTE clinical staff (with caseloads) who are NOT coded as health visitors 0.

4. How many children under-5 years of age were there in your local authority area?
(also, on 1st February of 2016, 2017, 2018 and 2019)

This data is published https://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/1114/population

5. Currently, who is the responsible manager for the health visiting service? Please
also provide their email address.

See answer to question 1

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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