Reference: FOI2869 B W

Request:

This is a freedom of information request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
Please provide the following information you have pertaining to care provision for adults
with learning disabilities (ages 18-64):

1. The total number of adults (ages 18-64) with learning disabilities in long term care,
as of 31 March 2020.
678

2. The total number of adults (ages 18-64) with learning disabilities in long term care
as of 31 March 2020, by average weekly fee/cost of care and care setting (please
fill in the table below).

Average weekly fee/cost of care (e.g. paid to
residential care provider)
Less than
£1 500 £1,500-£2,500 | More than £2,500

Residential care 32 13 9
Supported living 130 oo 13
Other care 347 55 32
setting

Residential care also contains nursing care

Points 1 and 2 are highest priority — please return your responses to those as soon as
they are ready. If points 3 and 4 result in a greater administrative burden or cost of
research, then we are happy for you to respond with them at a later date (or at later dates
for points 3 and 4 separately).

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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3. Please fill in the above table again, but with the corresponding information as of 31
Mar 2018.

Information not held. We are unable to report this due to a change in system
in November 2017.

4. Please fill in the above table again, but with the corresponding information as of 31
Mar 2015.

Information not held. We are unable to report this due to a change in system
in November 2017.

If you hold this information, please return it electronically.
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