Reference: FOI2912 =

North Tyneside Council

Request:

1.1 How many Looked After Children aged 16 and 17 does the council currently have?
68 (34 aged 16; 34 aged 17)

1.2 How many of these Looked After Children aged 16 and 17 does the council currently
house in Semi Independent Accommodation?
15

1.3 Please provide the names of the companies who provide semi independent
accommodation to your Looked After Children aged 16 and 17.
e Starting Point/EIm House - in house provision
DePaul
Forever Care
New Key
Jigsaw

1.4 Please provide the average cost per child per week per provider
We do not hold averages.

2.1 How many Care Leavers 18 plus does the council currently house in Semi
Independent Accommodation?

e Supported accommodation: 14

e Supported tenancies: 12

e Supported lodgings: 1

2.2 Please provide the names of the companies who provide accommodation to your Care
Leavers aged 18 plus

NEST (North East Supported Tenancies);

New Key;

DePaul UK;

YMCA;

Starting Point;

Elm House;

Maritime Court.

2.3 Please provide the average cost per child per week per provider
The Authority do not hold averages.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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