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Request: 
 
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following 
information from North Tyneside Council 
 
I would be most grateful if you would supply me with the following information. 
 
1. The total number of your workforce as a whole 
3117 council employees 
 
2. The total number of staff who have died FROM Covid 19 within your organisation 
2 
 
3. The total number of staff who have been admitted to hospital as a result of Covid 19  
Information not held. We do not record this information 
 
4. The total number of staff who have been properly diagnosed with Covid 19 not requiring 
hospitalisation  
Information not held. We do not record this information. 
 
5. The total number of staff who have had to take time off work through isolation 
procedures not counting when the offices were actually closed  
Between March 2020 and August 2020 inclusive, there were 621 staff. The public 
sector organisations were required to remain working, however there were some 
services which required temporary closure due to the pandemic, such as leisure 
centres, where the employees were available for work, they were redeployed to the 
Local Community Support Hub and other frontline services. 


