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Request: 
 
This request seeks to collect data for individuals living in Supported Living and Residential 
Care settings with Learning Disabilities including those with Learning Disabilities and 
Autism.   
We are not asking for information related to those with only Autism who do not have a 
Learning Disability.   
 
LD Supported Living: 
 
1. Please complete the following table with the information requested for the last 

complete week available and confirm the week commencing date here: 17/10/2022 
 
NB: The exact number of hours can't be calculated as some services are provided in 
block shared between several clients. The number of clients supported by each service 
type are provided as a possible alternative. This does not include supported living 
purchased by clients via direct payments and ISFs. 

Category Total Hours for the 
Week 

Mean 
hourly 
rate 
paid  

Median 
hourly 
rate 
paid 

Lowest 
hourly rate 
paid 

Highest 
hourly rate 
paid 

Hours 
provided 
during the 
day 

Block Core Hours 
(Complex): 47 Clients 
 
Block Core Hours (Non 
Complex): 70 Clients 
 
Individual Hours 
(Complex): 74 Clients 
 
Individual Hours (Non 
Complex): 110 Clients 
 

* Non-
Complex 
£16.65 per 
hour 

Complex 
£17.26 per 
hour 

Wake hours 
provided 
during the 
night 

Block Waking Nights 
(Complex): 32 Clients 
 
Block Waking Nights 
(Non Complex): 
4 Clients 
 
Individual Waking 
Night (Complex): 
5 Clients 

* 10 hours at 
the above 
rate 

10 hours at 
the above 
rate 
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Individual Waking 
Night (Non Complex): 
1 Clients 
 

Sleep-ins 
provided 

Block Sleep In: 
122 Clients 
 
Individual Sleep In: 
30 Clients 
 

* £103.05 per night 

 
Residential LD Care: 
 
2. Please complete the following table with the information requested for the last 

complete week available and confirm the week commencing date here: __________ 
 

Category Mean rate 
paid  

Median 
rate paid 

Lowest 
rate paid 

Highest rate paid 

Placements 
within the 
last 6 months 

* £564.96  

 
Information not held, all 
placements would be 
negotiated and costed 
differently dependent on 
needs of the individual. 
 

Current total 
placements 
today 

75 (as at 23/10/2022) 

 
 
Nursing LD Care 
 
3. Please complete the following table with the information requested for the last 

complete week available and confirm the week commencing date here: __________ 
 

Category Mean rate 
paid  

Median 
rate paid 

Lowest 
rate paid 

Highest rate paid 

Placements 
within the 
last 6 months 

* The Authority does not have any in-borough 
Nursing homes that deliver services for 
profound and multiple learning disability 
clients. These clients would be placed out of 
the Borough and we link in with the host 
Authority with regard to the fees paid. 

Current total 5 (as at 23/10/2022) 
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placements 
today 

 
4. Please provide the annual fee uplift for the current financial period. If you have paid a 

bespoke uplift to each provider, please provider the average % uplift paid to providers 
in the period stated: 

 
(Supported Living) 

Year Percentage 
uplift 

Number of 
Providers 
receiving 
this uplift 

Number of 
Individuals 
receiving 
this uplift 

2022-23 7.58% 27 212 

 
(Residential Care) 

Year Percentage 
uplift 

Number of 
Providers 
receiving 
this uplift 

Number of 
Individuals 
receiving 
this uplift 

2022-23 7.4% 8 43 

 
(Residential Care with Nursing) 

Year Percentage uplift Number of 
Providers 
receiving 
this uplift 

Number of 
Individuals 
receiving 
this uplift 

2022-23 Information not held. 
The Authority does not have any in-borough 
Nursing homes that deliver services for 
profound and multiple learning disability 
clients. These clients would be placed out of 
the Borough and we link in with the host 
Authority in which the home is located for 
annual price increases and match any 
increases put in place by the host Authority. 

  

 
 
5. Please provide details of the number of contracts for the provision of LD services for 

both residential care and supported living where the provider has given notice 
terminating the contract during the last 12 months including the number of service 
users or residents subject to the contract; and in addition, the numbers of such 
contracts which have:  

a. terminated immediately.  
b. terminated following a reprovision of services by the Council; or  
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c. continued on new terms agreed with the same provider, following termination. 
 

Number of Contracts where the provider has given notice 
terminating the contract during the last 12 months 

0 

Number of Residents/Service Users where the provider has 
given notice terminating the contract during the last 12 
months 

0 

Number of Contracts terminated immediately 0 

Number of Contracts terminated following a reprovision of 
services by the Council 

0 

Number of Contracts continued on new terms agreed with the 
same provider, following termination 

0 

 
 
 
* A request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 entitles an applicant to recorded 
information only. Averages are not recorded by the Authority. Where lowest and highest 
rates are provided you should be able to calculate your own averages. 


