Refere nce. FOI'287 North'l’ynesade Council

Request:

1.

How many incidences of antisocial behaviour were recorded by your council in
every year between 2010 and 2022.

For the incidences mentioned above, how many resulted in:
a. ASB civil injunctions

b. Community protection notices

c. Public space protection orders

d. Closure powers

e. No further action

In how many instances did your local authority apply, or encourage the prosecution
to apply, for a Criminal Behaviour Order?

Response:

1.

Information not held. No figure is held for the total number of reports in any given
time period. Reports of antisocial behaviour come into the Authority in multiple
ways including email, telephone (to multiple departments), website enquiries and
letter. To provide a total would require collating figures from 10,000s of enquiries
per year.

Limited data is held for specific actions taken as below:

a. ASB civil injunctions: 47 (data from 2010 to date)
b. Community protection notices: 49 (data from 2014 to date)

c. Public space protection orders: 5 (data from 2017 to date)

d. Closure powers: 49 (data from 2010 to date)

e. No further action: Information not held as the total number of reports is not held
by the Authority.

3. 0 (zero). The Authority has not applied for any CBOs

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
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