Reference: FOI-590 T

North Me;lc;e Council

Request:
| would like to request, under the freedom of information act, the following information.

1. On October census day in 2022, 2021, 2020, 2019 and 2018, how many children
and young people were you aware of being electively home educated in your local
area?

2. On October census day in 2022, 2021, 2020, 2019 and 2018, what percentage of
your statutory school aged (5 — 16) population were electively home educated?

3. How many formal notifications for elective home education were made in each of
the last four academic years (2021-22, 2020-21, 2019-20 and 2018-19)?

4. Of the notifications in each year, how many were from a) mainstream schools and
b) special schools

5. Please rank, in order from highest to lowest, the Key Stage groups with the highest
number of notifications for EHE between in each of the last four academic years

6. During each of the last four academic years, how many local children were known
to be electively home educated at any point across the academic year (the
cumulative total)?

7. What percentage of the total number of children who are electively home educated
have an education, health and care plan (EHCP) as captured on census day in
2022, 2021, 2020, 2019 and 20187

Please note, these questions are the same as those asked in the annual ADCS survey of
councils on EHE, which we understand did not take place in 2022, but did take place in all
the other years covered by this FOI. Please bear this in mind if the council is minded to
refuse the request on the grounds that responding would breach time and cost limits.

Response:

Please note, where data has not been recorded on Census Day, the data for the nearest
date has been provided as an alternative.

1. 2022: 136
2021: 121
2020: 109
2019: 92
2018: 65 (as of 26/11/2018)

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 OBY
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<0.5%
<0.5%
0.5-1%
<0.5%
<0.5%

2.

2022:
2021:
2020:
2019:
2018:

2021/2022:
2020/2021:
2019/2020:
2018/2019:

2021/2022:

85
62
39
This information was not recorded at that time.

63 from mainstream schools and 5 from special schools (NB: 17 moved

into the Local Authority area as EHE)

2020/2021:
2019/2020:
2018/2019:

2021/2022:
2020/2021:
2019/2020:
2018/2019:

2021/2022:
2020/2021:
2019/2020:
2018/2019:

58 from mainstream schools and 4 from special schools
This information was not recorded to that level of detail at that time.
This information was not recorded at that time.

KS2/KS3/KS4 all equal, then KS1
KS3, KS2, KS4 then KS1

KS2, KS3/KS4 both equal then KS1
KS4, KS3, KS2, KS1

214
93
102
91

2022: 6-10%
2021: 6-10%
2020: 6-10%

2019: 0-5%

2018: This information was not recorded at that time
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