

Reference: FOI0025

Request:

Can you please send me details for the period 2017-18 on the following:

1. The total value of the courier service contracts that were outsourced?

This service is not outsourced

2. The name of your primary and any secondary Courier supplier

N/A

3. The value of your primary supplier contract, its expiry date and the services they provide (e.g. same day/next-day/overnight)

N/A

4. The value of your secondary supplier's contract, its expiry date and the and services they provide (e.g. same day/next-day/overnight)

Answer

N/A

5. The total cost of the courier services that were managed in-house?

This information is not held as the staff that courier information also undertake other duties. And as such the information relating specifically to the Courier service is not recorded separately

- 6. The number of staff employed in managing those contracts
- 2. Also see above response
- 7. The number of vehicles owned or leased to meet the in-house courier requirement

2

8. The name and email of the person responsible for the procurement/management of these services?

Wendy Rochester. wendy.rochester@northtyneside.gov.uk

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 27/06/2018 Page 1 of 1