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Request: 
 
 
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following 
information:  
1. How many packages of residential social care in care homes based outside the 
boundaries of your area have you commissioned in each of the last four financial years 
for: 
a. People aged between 18 and 65? 
b. People aged over 65? 
 
please see attachment 
 
2. What was the greatest distance (in miles) between your area and a care home in which 
you have commissioned a package of residential social care in each of the last four 
financial years for: 
a. People aged between 18 and 65; 
b. People aged over 65; 
and what was the post code of this care home? 
 
This information is not held 
 
3. The total amount spent on residential social care in each of the last four financial years 
for: 
a. People aged between 18 and 65? 
b. People aged over 65? 
 
4. The total amount spent on residential social care in care homes based outside the 
boundaries of your area in each of the last four financial years for: 
a. People aged between 18 and 65? 
b. People aged over 65? 
 
The Local Authority do not hold the information in the format requested we do 
publish information on Residential Social Care which can be accessed via the link 
below 
 
Nationally Reported Statistics & Information 
 
Local authority revenue expenditure and financing 
 
This links to all documents relating to local authority revenue expenditure and 
financing. In any given year there should be a record of local government 
expenditure and finance, sorted by local authority. The information is often referred 
to as the RA and RO returns. The RA relates to the budgeted expenditure and 
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financing, the RO is the outturn or actual expenditure and financing. The link to the 
government site where this information is held is below: 
 
https://www.gov.uk/government/collections/local-authority-revenue-expenditure-
and-financing  
 
From these sheets the local authority data relating to North Tyneside Council can 
be selected, providing spend information for the authority split by defined 
expenditure and financing categories. 
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