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Request: 
 
Please can you provide me with: 

1. The names of the schools in your area that contain asbestos. Ideally, I would like this broken down into type of 
asbestos (white, brown and/or blue). 

Property Name Property Postcode Chrysotile Amosite  Crocidolite  

Amberley Primary School NE12 6SQ Y Y   

Appletree Gardens First School NE25 8XS Y Y Y 

Bailey Green Primary School NE12 6QL Y Y   

Balliol Primary NE12 8QP Y Y Y 

Battle Hill Primary NE28 9DH Y Y   

Carville Primary NE28 6DX Y   Y 

Christ Church C of E NE30 2AD Y Y Y 

Churchill Community College NE28 7TN Y     

Collingwood Primary NE29 7JQ Y Y Y 

Cullercoats Community Primary 
School 

NE30 4PB Y Y   

Denbigh Community Primary NE28 0DS Y   Y 

Fordley Community Primary NE23 7AL Y Y   

Forest Hall Primary School NE12 9BA Y Y   

George Stephenson Community High NE12 6SA Y Y Y 



 
 
Reference: FOI1624 

 
 
The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial 
research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of 
Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY  
 

Date: XXXXXX Page 2 of 10  
 

Greenfields Community Primary NE13 6NB Y Y Y 

Hadrian Park Primary NE28 9RT Y     

Hazlewood Primary NE13 6JJ Y Y   

Ivy Road Primary NE12 9AP Y Y Y 

John Spence Community High 
(Drama block only) 

NE29 9PU Y     

King Edward Primary NE30 2BD Y Y Y 

Langley First School NE25 9DF Y     

Marden Bridge Middle School NE25 8RW Y Y Y 

Monkhouse Primary NE30 3SH Y Y Y 

Monkseaton Middle NE25 9AQ Y Y Y 

Moorbridge  NE27 0HJ Y      

New York Primary NE29 8DP Y     

Norham High School NE29 7AX Y Y Y 

Percy Main Primary NE29 6JA Y Y   

Preston Grange Primary NE29 9QL Y Y Y 

Redesdale Primary NE28 8TS Y     

Richardson Dees Primary NE28 7RT Y     

Rockcliffe First School NE26 2NR Y Y Y 

Shiremoor Primary NE27 0PW Y     

Sir James Knott Nursery NE30 4AG Y     

South Wellfield First NE25 9QL Y Y   

Southlands NE30 2QR Y Y Y 
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Southridge First NE25 9UD Y Y   

Spring Gardens Primary NE29 0HP Y     

St Aidan's RC Primary School NE28 0EP Y Y Y 

St Bernadettes RC Primary NE28 9JW Y Y   

St Columba's RC NE28 8EN Y Y   

St Cuthbert's RC NE29 0BU Y     

St Josephs RC NE29 7BT Y Y Y 

St Marys RC Forest Hall NE12 7AB Y Y   

St Marys RC  North Shields NE30 3EY Y Y   

Star Of The Sea RC NE25 9DY Y Y   

Valley Gardens Middle NE25 9AQ Y Y Y 

Wallsend Jubilee Primary NE28 9HA Y Y Y 

Wallsend St Peters C of E Primary NE28 6PY Y     

Wellfield Middle School NE25 9QW Y     

Whitley Bay High NE25 9AS Y Y Y 

Whitley Lodge First NE26 3HW Y Y Y 

Woodlawn School NE25 9DF Y     

2. The date and outcome of the last independent audit or inspection of each of these schools Asbestos Management 
Plans. 

Name of School ACM present Date of last inspection Outcome 
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Amberley Community Primary Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant 

Appletree Gardens First Yes 18/03/2019 Compliant 

Backworth Park Primary No N/A N/A 

Bailey Green Primary Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Balliol Primary Yes 11/12/2018 Complaint 

Battle Hill Community Primary Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant 

Beacon Hill School No N/A N/A 

Benton Dene Primary School No N/A N/A 

Benton Dene School No N/A N/A 

Burnside Business & Enterprise 
College 

No N/A N/A 

Burradon Community Primary No N/A N/A 

Carville Primary Yes 19/06/2019 Compliant 

Christ Church C of E Primary Yes 22/06/2019 Open remedial actions 

Churchill Community College Yes 10/12/2018 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Collingwood Primary Yes 22/02/2019 Compliant 

Coquet Park First No N/A N/A 

Cullercoats Community Primary Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Denbigh Community Primary Yes 30/07/2019 Compliant 

Fordley Primary Yes 03/06/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Forest Hall Primary Yes 21/05/2019 Open remedial actions 

George Stephenson High Yes 29/01/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Greenfields Community Primary Yes 30/04/2019 Compliant 

Hadrian Park Primary Yes 04/06/2019 Compliant 
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Hazlewood Community Primary Yes 23/05/2019 Compliant 

Holystone Primary No N/A N/A 

Ivy Road Primary Yes 10/04/2019 Compliant 

John Spence Community High 
(Drama block only) 

Yes 23/11/2018 Compliant 

King Edward Primary Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Langley First Yes 05/03/2019 Compliant 

Longbenton High School No N/A N/A 

Marden Bridge Middle Yes 30/01/2019 Open remedial actions 

Marden High No N/A N/A 

Marine Park First No N/A N/A 

Monkhouse Primary Yes 22/02/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Monkseaton High No N/A N/A 

Monkseaton Middle Yes 14/03/2019 Compliant 

Moorbridge Yes 26/09/2019 Compliant 

New York Primary Yes 30/04/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Norham High School Yes 11/03/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Percy Main Primary Yes 23/11/2018 Open remedial actions 

Preston Grange Primary Yes 28/06/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Redesdale Primary Yes 23/05/2019 Compliant 

Richardson Dees Primary Yes 30/04/2019 Compliant 

Riverside Primary No N/A N/A 

Rockcliffe First Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant 

Shiremoor Primary Yes 30/04/2019 Compliant 
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Silverdale No N/A N/A 

Sir James Knott Nursery Yes 29/04/2019 Compliant 

South Wellfield First Yes 22/06/2019 Compliant 

Southlands Yes 29/05/2019 Open remedial actions 

Southridge First Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant 

Spring Gardens Primary Yes 23/05/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

St Aidan's Rcva Primary Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant 

St. Bartholomew's C of E 
Primary 

No N/A N/A 

St. Bernadette's Rcva Primary Yes 03/06/2019 Open remedial actions 

St. Columba's Rcva Primary Yes 23/05/2019 Compliant 

St. Cuthbert's Rcva Primary Yes 07/03/2019 Compliant 

St. Joseph's Rcva Primary Yes 14/12/2018  Compliant 

St. Mary's (F/Hall) Rcva Primary Yes 12/12/2018 Open remedial actions 

St. Mary's Rcva (N/S) Primary Yes 22/10/2018 Compliant 

St. Stephen's Rcva Primary No N/A N/A 

Star Of The Sea Rcva Primary Yes 29/04/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Stephenson Memorial Primary No N/A N/A 

Valley Gardens Middle Yes 23/05/2019 Compliant - Open remedial actions 

Wallsend Jubilee Primary Yes 29/04/2019 Compliant 

Wallsend St Peter's C of E 
Primary 

Yes 28/03/2019 Compliant 

Waterville Primary No N/A N/A 

Wellfield Middle Yes 22/06/2018 Compliant 
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Western Community Primary No N/A N/A 

Westmoor Primary No N/A N/A 

Whitehouse Primary No N/A N/A 

Whitley Bay High Yes 22/02/2019 Open remedial actions 

Whitley Lodge First Yes 08/05/2019 Compliant 

Woodlawn Yes 27/03/2019 Compliant 

3. The details of any reported incidents of asbestos exposure in these schools between 2010 and 2019. 

There have been no reported incidents of asbestos exposure in these schools between 2010 and 2019.  

4. Details of any improvement or prohibition notice served or guidance issued by the HSE in relation to the 
management of asbestos in schools in your area in the last 5 years. 

None 

5. The number of school employees (existing and retired staff to include teaching staff, school support staff and 
caretakers, etc) and ex-pupils that have pursued a claim against the Council for exposure to asbestos within a school in your 
area. 

This information is not held by the Authority for the purposes of the Act. 
 
It is held by the Authority on behalf of each individual school. 
 
Therefore, this information should be requested directly from each school. 
 
Link to schools to contact details can be found here: 
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http://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/128/find-school 

 

6. The number of these claims that have been settled. 

This information is not held by the Authority for the purposes of the Act. 
 
It is held by the Authority on behalf of each individual school. 
 
Therefore, this information should be requested directly from each school. 
 
Link to schools to contact details can be found here: 
 
http://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/128/find-school 

 

7. The amount of money that has been paid in settlement of these claims (with and without your authority accepting 
responsibility). 

This information is not held by the Authority for the purposes of the Act. 
 
It is held by the Authority on behalf of each individual school. 
 
Therefore, this information should be requested directly from each school. 
 
Link to schools to contact details can be found here: 
 

http://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/128/find-school
http://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/128/find-school
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http://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/128/find-school 
 

8. The details of training offered to school governors, teachers or similar who carry out an inspection. 

Training is provided by the Health and Safety team and is advertised accessed/offered to all through the online Education 
Services Portal.  

Outline 

This course provides an overview of ways to manage asbestos containing materials in North Tyneside Schools. It is aimed at 
giving introductory knowledge to help duty holders and appointed persons to comply with their responsibilities under current 
regulations.  
 
Description 
 
This training course gives duty holders and appointed persons an introduction and basic understanding of their legal 
responsibilities under the control of asbestos regulations. It provides understanding on the Shine database and provides advice 
on ways to manage asbestos within your school establishment.  

9. The number of 'System-Built Schools' in your area. 

There are 3 system-built schools within North Tyneside.  

• 1 CLASP 
• 2 SCOLA 

http://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/128/find-school
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10. The number of schools that have dealt with a leaky roof or a broken window or a damaged wall panel, during the past 5 
years. (i.e. where the fabric of the building has been disturbed). 

Asset Management do not hold this information. Schools hold their own budget and as such commission their own repair work. 
Asset are there in an advisory capacity to ensure works are carried out in a safe manner.  

11. Finally, details of when and why you have commissioned emergency asbestos air testing across your school's 
estate. 

Emergency air monitoring is only carried when there has been a report of suspect ACM’s that may have been disturbed. This is 
in line the Councils Asbestos Management Procedure, and escalation process.  

 
 


