



Reference: FOI3902

Request:

- a. For the last financial year (2020-2021) how many fines or fixed penalty notices did your authority issue for fly-tipping?

19

- b. How many were paid/unpaid?

2

- c. What was the total revenue received from these fines or FPNs? (i.e. actually received by your authority)

£800

- d. What is the total amount (in £s) unpaid after 30 days?

£800

- e. How much was spent on issuing these fines?

Information not held.

2)

- a. For the last financial year (2020-2021) how many times did your authority prosecute individuals or businesses for fly-tipping?

0

- b. How many resulted in convictions?

N/A

- c. Was any revenue received as compensation?

N/A

- d. Was any revenue received as costs?

N/A

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY



Reference: FOI3902

- e. How much was spent on these prosecutions?

N/A

- f. What is the total amount of compensation awarded unpaid?

N/A

- g. What is the total amount of costs awarded unpaid?

N/A

3. For the last financial year (2020-2021) how many cases of fly-tipping did your authority deal with?

4806 reports of fly-tipping have been recorded for 2020-21.

4. For the last financial year (2020-2021), what was the total cost to your authority of dealing with cleaning up fly-tipping?

Information not held - the specific cost of clearing up fly tipping is not recorded, it is part of the wider budget for Street Cleansing and Waste Disposal but is not specifically broken down in this level of detail

5. How many people live in your local authority area?

<https://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/1114/population#:~:text=The%20population%20of%20North%20Tyneside%20is%20207%2C913.>

6. How many cases of fly-tipping were reported to your authority on private land?

Please see below table for locations of reported fly-tipping in 2020-21:

- **Watercourse/Bank - 20**
- **Unknown - 129**
- **Other (Unidentified) - 433**
- **Back Alleyway - 1918**
- **Council Land - 1011**
- **Highway - 221**
- **Railway - 8**
- **Commercial / Industrial - 76**
- **Private - Residential - 158**
- **Footpath/Bridleway - 832**

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY