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Request: 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act (2000), I request the following information: 
  
1. The number of tenants of the council who were injured in accidents which occurred in their 

home. This includes the whole building, i.e. corridors, stairwells and on-site outdoor areas in 
multi-unit blocks, or any other part of the site. I would like this information for the following 
periods: 

 
i. 2016/17 
ii. 2015/16 
iii. 2014/15 
iv. 2013/14 
v. 2012/13 
vi. 2011/12 
vii. 2010/11 

  
2. The number of tenants of the council who were killed in accidents which occurred in their 

home. This includes the whole building, i.e. corridors, stairwells and on-site outdoor areas in 
multi-unit blocks. I would like this information for the following periods: 
 

i. 2016/17 
ii. 2015/16 
iii. 2014/15 
iv. 2013/14 
v. 2012/13 
vi. 2011/12 
vii. 2010/11 

  
If possible, I would like the information for both 1) and 2) to be categorised by nature of incident, 
e.g. slip on stairs, electrocution, etc. 
 
Response: 
 
1. Please note, Housing do not hold any records relating to tenants who were injured in 

accidents which occurred in their home in general needs housing.  However, the number of 
recorded incidents in our retirement homes are as follows: 

 
i. 2016/17 – Total = 0 
ii. 2015/16 – Total = 5. (2 x slip/trip/fall, 3 x hit by moving object) 
iii. 2014/15 – Total = 5. (2 x slip/trip/fall, 1 x hit by moving object, 2 x hit something 

stationary) 
iv. 2013/14 – Total = 0 
v. 2012/13 – Total = 10. (6 x slip/trip/fall, 3 x hit by moving object, 1 x hit something 

stationary) 
vi. 2011/12 – Total = 9.  (7 x slip/trip/fall, 1 x hit by moving object, 1 x exposed to fire) 
vii. 2010/11 – Total = 9.  (7 x slip/trip/fall, 1 x hit something stationary, 1 x hit by moving 

object) 
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2. As above, Housing do not hold any records relating to tenants killed in accidents which 

occurred in their home in general needs housing.  However, the number of recorded 
incidents in our retirement homes are as follows: 

 
i. 2016/17 – Total = 0 
ii. 2015/16 – Total = 0 
iii. 2014/15 – Total = 0 
iv. 2013/14 – Total = 0 
v. 2012/13 – Total = 0 
vi. 2011/12 – Total = 0 
vii. 2010/11 – Total = 0 

 


