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Request: 
 
I wish to request information via the FOI act, regarding the allotments of north tyneside and wondered if you 
are able to provide the following information which is structured so that it is easier to read and understand (I 
am dyslexic)  
 
1: Could you list all allotment sites within north tyneside and include the following information: (2014-present 
info)  
 
Profits from rents –  
Response: The figures in the table below reflect the annual budgets (including Income from Rents) for 
providing an allotment service within North Tyneside: 

Financial 
Year 

Total Expenditure 
Budget 

Total Income 
Budget 

Net Expenditure 
Budget 

2014/15 £92,211 -£115,028 -£22,817  

2015/16 £92,785 -£115,028 -£22,243  

2016/17 £93,409 -£115,028 -£21,619  

2017/18 £93,286 -£115,028 -£21,742  

 
Current plots per allotment –  
See attachment (Council managed plots only) 
 
Current vacant plots –  
See attachment (Council managed plots only).  All vacant plots are in the process of being let. 
 
Current waiting list totals per allotment  
See attachment (Council managed plots only).  Only current data available, the individual site waiting list 
information is not held for previous years as it changes on a weekly basis.  
 
 
2: Please list the allotment sites which have received the most funding in a 1-10 format over the years 2014 
to present?  
Information is not available to show how much expenditure (or funding) is incurred against each allotment 
site. See above response to Profits from Rents question for costs/funding.  
 
3: Please list the amount of site visitors the council have completed in total to each allotment site over 2014 
to the present day.  
This information is not held as the Allotment Service aim to visit each allotment site every 2 months for 
inspection purposes in April, June, August and October.  Re-inspections are carried out in May, July, 
September and November, on sites where letters have been sent to tenants following the initial inspection.  
Sites are also visited on an ad hoc basis for letting plots, health and safety issues, repairs etc. 
 
4: From 2014-2017 Please list how many people have been evicted from sites and the allotment sites they 
have been evicted from?  
See attachment (Council managed plots only). 
 
 
5: Could you provide any prospect of new allotment sites which have been confirmed?  
None. 
 


