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Request: 
 
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request information regarding 

traffic calming measures. 

Specifically, please provide the following figures: 

  

1) Total number of installations of speed bumps and associated traffic calming measures 

on roads in the local authority area (please provide a breakdown for each type of 

measure) 

Information is not held 

 

2) Total number of roads fitted with speed bumps and associated traffic calming measures 

Information is not held 

 

3) Total number of road miles fitted with speed bumps and associated traffic calming 

measures 

Information is not held 

 

4) A yearly breakdown of installations referenced in Question 1 for last three years  

 

2015/16 

Cockburn Terrace, North Shields Raised Table 

Goathland Ave, Longbenton Raised Table 

Hailsham Ave, Longbenton Raised Table 

The Gardens / Chestnut Ave Junction Narrowing 

 

2016/17 

No traffic calming humps / cushions installed 

 

2017/18 

Coach Lane, North Shields Raised Table 

Eccles Grange, Backworth Raised Table 

Addingtonm Drive, Hadrian Road Rasied Table 

Whitley Road, Holystone Raised Table 

Mullen Road, Wallsend Speed Cushion 

Beaumont Drive, Whitley Bay Raised Table 

 

5) Total number of miles of roads the council is responsible for maintaining/installing traffic 

calming measures 

 

Information is not held. 

 


