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Request: 

1. Please state the total number of roads which had parking restrictions throughout 
your council area in the last three years*? 

• 2019 
• 2020 
• 2021 

The Authority does not retain a list of the number of roads in the borough that 
contain parking restrictions. Details of the parking restrictions and their locations 
are contained within the Authority's Waiting/Loading and On-Street Parking Places 
Consolidation Orders that are attached. 

2. In the last three years, please state the total number of roads that had residential 
parking permits: 

• 2019 
• 2020 
• 2021 

See response to question 1. 

3. In the last three years, how many penalty charge notices have been handed out for 
breaching parking restrictions in your council area? 

• 2019 
• 2020 
• 2021 

During the financial year 2018/19 - 26,012 penalty charge notices were issued for 
parking contraventions During the financial year 2019/20 - 24,565 penalty charge 
notices were issued for parking contraventions During the financial year 2020/21 - 
18,342 penalty charge notices were issued for parking contraventions 

4. What was the total value of these fines? 

• 2019 
• 2020 
• 2021 

This Authority operates parking enforcement under civil parking arrangements 
authorised by the Traffic Management Act 2004. Under the legislation, the penalty 
charge value is dependent on which contravention code is committed and 
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increases as the penalty charge progresses through the statutory process. It may 
also include County Court costs if the penalty charge is unpaid and the debt 
registered. If a Warrant of Execution is subsequently obtained and passed to an 
Enforcement Agent, then they can add additional costs to the debt to cover their 
costs. 

The Authority cannot break down the income received from parking fines issued in 
a financial year from the income received from bus lane fines issued in the same 
year. All the income is received in the same fund stream and includes payments 
made in this year for penalty charge notices that may have been issued for parking 
and bus lane contraventions in previous years. 

 


