Reference: FOI0740

North Tyr;e;ide Council

Request:

| am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following
information:

1. How much did your local authority spend on aids and adaptations in each of the
last four years?

15/16 £1.830m
16/17 £2.060m
17/18 £2.040m
18/19 £1.982m (not finalised)

2. How much did you spend on aids and adaptations as a proportion of the social care
budget in each of the last four years?

15/16 1.23%
16/17 1.39%
17/18 1.16%
18/19 1.19%

3. What forms of aids and adaptations did your local authority spend money on?
See attached.

4. How many people did you support to secure aids and adaptations to their homes in
each of the last four years?

14/15 8,217
15/16 8,663
16/17 9,652
17/18 10,123

5. What proportion of people who have received aids and adaptations in each of the
last four years have also had a care plan in place?

Information not held.

6. How much of the social care budget was spent on prevention in each of the last
four years?

Information not held.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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