

Reference: FOI1116

Request:

- 1. I would like to request the following information regarding the fees charged for all football pitch hire in your jurisdiction for the years 2016, 2017 and 2018:
- a. A breakdown of the revenue generated (in pounds sterling) from hiring artificial football pitches on council-owned property, monthly and per year.
- b. A breakdown of the revenue generated (in pounds sterling) from hiring natural grass football pitches on council-owned property, monthly and per year.

2016/17: (£0.034m) 2017/18: (£0.032m) 2018/19: (£0.032m)

Figures above reflect annual revenue income from grass pitches only on council owned property. Annual revenue income from hiring of artificial football pitches is not recorded.

- 2. I would like to request the following information regarding the maintenance costs for football pitches in your jurisdiction for the years 2016, 2017 and 2018:
- a. The amount of money (in pounds sterling) that was invested into the maintenance of artificial football pitches on council-owned property, monthly and per year;
- b. The amount of money (in pounds sterling) that was invested into the maintenance of natural grass football pitches on council-owned property, monthly and per year;
- c. The amount of money (expressed as a percentage) that was invested into the maintenance of artificial football pitches on council-owned property as a proportion of your overall council budget, monthly and per year;
- d. The amount of money (expressed as a percentage) that was invested into the maintenance of natural grass football pitches on council-owned property as a proportion of your overall council budget, monthly and per year.

Information is not held in a format to determine the amount of money invested on the maintenance of artificial or grass football pitches on a yearly (or monthly) basis.

Information not held in a format to determine the amount of money invested on the maintenance of artificial or grass football pitches as a proportion of the overall council budget on a yearly (or monthly) basis.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 27/06/2019 Page 1 of 1