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North Tyt;eiide Council

Reference: FOI1211

Request:

1. How many schools is your council responsible for?
- Secondary schools:
- Primary schools:

This information is exempt under section 21, information reasonably accessible to
the applicant by other means, of the FOI Act as it is published on the Authority’s
website at the following link:

https://my.northtyneside.gov.uk/category/128/find-school

2. Has the council identified ‘period poverty’ as a priority?
Yes

3. How many schools provide or are due to provide paid-for sanitary provisions (e.g.
sanitary towels, tampons) for pupils?

This information is not held by the Local Authority

- Number of secondary schools:
- Name of secondary schools:

- Number of primary schools:

- Number of primary schools:

4. How many schools provide or are due to provide free sanitary products (e.g. sanitary
towels, tampons) for pupils?

This information is not held by the Local Authority

- Number of secondary schools:

- Name of secondary schools and format free sanitary products are provided e.g. basket in
toilet, basket behind reception/school nurse, vending machine, on request to teacher:

- Number of primary schools:

- Number of primary schools and format free sanitary products are provided e.g. basket in
toilet, basket behind reception/school nurse, on request to teacher:

N/A

5. Does your council have funding allocated for period poverty and/or providing free
sanitary products within schools?

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use
it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a
commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and
Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY
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6. Have you already invested or do you have plans to invest in any period poverty/free
sanitary product measures? If so, please detail and include whether this has been
completed or is planned for the future.

No
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