

Reference: FOI1629

Request:

Q1. Leisure & Culture

- a. How many libraries were run and staffed by your council in
- b. 2010/11 **15**
- ii. 2015/16 **14**
- iii. 2018/19 **14**
 - b. How many libraries, that were once part of your council's statutory provision, were run exclusively by volunteers in
 - c. 2010/11 **0**
- ii. 2015/16 **0**
- iii. 2018/19 **0**
 - c. How many parks and open/green spaces were serviced by your council in
 - d. 2010/11 26
- ii. 2015/16 **26**
- iii. 2018/19 **26**

Q2. Children's and Youth Services

- a. How many children's centres and family hubs operated by your council were closed in the periods
- b. 2010/11 2014/15
- ii. 2015/16 2018/19

Children's Centres were not closed but were merged into four locality hubs covering the same areas. Surplus buildings were transferred to schools or leased to other childcare providers.

- b. How many youth centres previously operated by your council were closed in the periods
- c. 2010/11 2014/15 **0**
- ii. 2015/16 2018/19 **0**

The Youth Service was not closed but was merged with the wider Early Help Provision, based from our four locality hubs covering the same areas.

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 05/09/2019 Page 1 of 3



Reference: FOI1629

- c. How many young people were supported by your youth services in
- d. 2010/11 records for 2010/11 are no longer held as this date exceeds document retention periods.
- ii. 2015/16 there were 543 sessions delivered in 2015/16 for up to 12 young people at a time. Total attendance data is not held.
- iii. 2018/19 there were 712 sessions delivered in 2018/19 for up to 12 young people at a time. Total attendance data is not held.
 - d. How many youth workers and youth support workers were directly employed by your council in
 - e. 2010/11 records for 2010/11 are no longer held as this date exceeds document retention periods.
- ii. 2015/16 33 FTE, these are Family Partners, who have the responsibility for targeted youth provision, among their wider role.
- iii. 2018/19 **33 FTE (as above)**

Q3. Trading Standards

- a. How many members of staff were employed by your trading standards service in
- b. 2010/11 5
- ii. 2015/16 **2.5**
- iii. 2018/19 **2.3**
 - b. How many enforcement visits were carried out by your trading standards service in
 - c. 2010/11 No information held
- ii. 2015/16 **884**
- iii. 2018/19 **712**
 - c. How many prosecutions were commenced by your trading standards service in
 - d. 2010/11 No information held
- ii. 2015/16 **11**
- iii. 2018/19 **8**

Q4. Environmental Health

- a. How many members of staff were employed by your environmental health service in
- b. 2010/11 24
- ii. 2015/16 **16.4**

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 05/09/2019 Page 2 of 3



Reference: FOI1629

- iii. 2018/19 **16.4**
 - How many enforcement visits were carried out by your environmental health service in
 - c. 2010/11 No information held
- ii. 2015/16 **5822**
- iii. 2018/19 **4275**
 - c. How many prosecutions were commenced by your environmental health service in
 - d. 2010/11 No information held
- ii. 2015/16 **3**
- iii. 2018/19 **1**

Q5. Refuse services

- a. How many households received weekly refuse collections in
- b. 2010/11 approx. 95,000
- ii. 2015/16 approx 97,000
- iii. 2018/19 approx. 102,000
- Q6. Public toilets How many public toilets were maintained by your council in
 - i. 2010/11 **19**
 - ii. 2015/16 **16**
 - iii. 2018/19 **16**

Q7. Supported bus services

- a. How many supported bus service routes were cut or completely withdrawn in
- b. 2010/11 **0**
- ii. 2015/16 **0**
- iii. 2018/19 **0**
 - b. How many supported bus service routes were partly or completely subsidised by the council in
 - c. 2010/11 **0**
- ii. 2015/16 **0**
- iii. 2018/19 **0**

The information supplied to you is owned by the council unless otherwise stated and may be protected by copyright. You are free to use it for your own purposes, including any non-commercial research or for the purposes of news reporting. Any other re-use of a commercial nature will require the permission of the Council. Further enquiries in this respect should be directed to Head of Law and Governance, North Tyneside Council, Quadrant The Silver Link North, Cobalt Business Park, North Tyneside, NE27 0BY

Date: 05/09/2019 Page 3 of 3